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Prof. Dr. Thirumaleshwara Bhat
BE, M.Tech., Ph.D., MISTE

PRINCIPAL

14 August 2023

Ref. No: SMVITM/2023-24 @ :7-s

Benet George V

Chief Consultant
Bigeta Energy Solutions LLP

Dear Sir

Sub: Work Order for Green and Energy Audit
Ref: Your proposal no. BES/EA/222307O75 dated 251712023
GSTIN. 29AAITS758OB1Z4

Greetings from Shri Madhwa Vadiraja lnstitute of Technology & Management, Bantakal, Udupi,

With reference to the above subject, we hereby place the work order for the Green and Energy Audit of our college

Sl.No. Details of the ltem Total

Amount (ln Rs.)

1 Work order for comprehensive energy and green audit 80,000.00

GST 18% 1.4,400.00

Total 94,400.00

Please return the copy of this work order with your signature for record purpose

Terms & Conditions
1. Payment : 40% advance along with work order, 50% after the completion of field work and 1O %

on submission of report.
2, Taxes : 18% GST

3. Other terms and conditions as per your quotation.
Thank you

Yours truly
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L

Bigeta Energy Solutions ILP
K 2O6, Confident Atik, Somptrra Gate, Sarjapura

Bangalore-562125, Karnataka Code:29

email: info@bigetaenergy-com, Phone +91 9511800893
GSTIN : 29N\SFB4L99O177 LLPIN : AAK-4585

TAXINVOICE

lnvoice No 2324053 Dated 14-0*2013

Supplier Ref BESIEA,/222307075 Datr Dated : D.l@12A23 Other reference:

Buyers PO No SltlrllfM,l21,,zji-.24,1274 Dated ilt-G8.m23 SO No:

Billing Address
SHRI SODE VADIRAJA MI.JTT EDUCATION TRUST

Shri Madhwa Vadiraja lnstitute of Technology And Management,

Vishwothama Nagar, Bantakal, Udupi,
Karnataka, 5741Ls

GSTIN: 29AA|TS7580B1Z4

Code:29

Shipping Address
SHRI SODE VADIRA'A MUTT EDUCATION TRUST

SMVITM

Vishwothama Nagar, Bantakal, Udupi,
Karnataka, 574L15

GSTIN: 294AIT575808L24

CGST SGSTHSil/
sAc

f,od€ ary
Pri:e Per

Urdtt
Tartabh

imolrntt fufloajnt{ % Arnount{ Total Amount {
sl
No Item tlescription Unit

1

Comprehensive Energy and Green

Audit at sri Madh\ra Vadiraja lnstitute

of Technology and Management L t5 80,u)o.00 80,000.00 9 7z0o,OO 7.2W.@ 94,400.0O

INR Fourteen Thousand Four Hundred Onty

Tax Amount in Words

Total lnvoice Amount including Tax in Words

lilR Ninety FourThousand Four Hundred Only

Iotal l.Iab*eArmoum

Ad*GST
Add:SGST

IotalTax

Total lnt oice Arnount

8O,O(x,.OO

7,2OO.SA

7,200.0o

14400,0O

94ttoo.oo

Bigeta Energy Solutions LLP Contact Person

B€net George v email: Phone: +91 96118{X}893benet@bigetaenergy.com

Declaration

Ceritified that the particulars given are Uue and correct

Bank Details
Remit Name

Account No

Bank Name

Branch

IFSC Code

Bigeta Energy Solutions LIP
216r9020000ff 98
The Federal Bank Limited
Chambenahalli
FDRLflro2l@

Fortligeta E r€rgySdutions UP

Audrorised Slgnatory

NJANAL

BENFTGToRGE H;gffHb'
VADAKKSVILILA v^DAIOtrjl.ML

Date 2O8,@-t4
23t 5r! +05'30

L

to Bangalore Jurisdiction Only
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CHEQUE /NEFT PAYMENT Voucher

No. : 395

Account:
BIGETA ENERGY SOLUTIONS LLP
Agst Ref P2324017 39,200.00 Dr

Through :

HDFC-I/C (2431 991 028201 0)

On Account of:

Dated : 6-Sep-23

Amount

39,200.00

t39 .00

Authorised€igna'tory-

BEING THE GREEN ENERGY AUDIT CHARGES.
Amount (in words) :

lndian Rupees Thirty Nine Thousand Two Hundred Only

Receiver's Signature:

\
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CHEQUE /NEFT PAYMENT Voucher

No. : 318

Particulars

Dated : 17-Aug-23

Amount

37,760.00

{ 37,760.00

Account:
BIGETA ENERGY SOLUTIONS LLP
Agst Ref P2324015 37,760.00 Dr

Through :

H D FC-A/C (2431 99 1 028201 0)

On Account of:
BEING THE GREEN AUDIT CHARGES
Bank Transaction Details:
NEFT C79588170823160631 I7-Aug-23

Amount (in words) :

lndian Rupees Thirty Seven Thousand red

Receiver's Signature:

4-0@ *

Q,**
Authorised Signatory

$
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CHEQUE /NEFT PAYMENT Voucher

No. : 428

ER 1070 TDS
oN 17.8.2023,

Dated :16-Sep-23

Amount

9,440.00

t .00

Authorised Signatory

Verified by

L

Particulars

Account:
BIGETA ENERGY SOLUTIONS LLP
Agst Ref 2324053 9,440.00 Dr

Through :

HDFC-A/C (2431 991 028201 0)

On Account of :

BEING THE GREEN ENERGY AUDIT CHARGES PAID. (AFT
BOOOO+GST 1B%) LESS RS BOOO TDSl ST PAYIVIENT 37 ,760
2ND PAYMENT 39200 ON 06.09.2023 BALANCE PAID NOW

Amount (in words) :

lndian Rupees Nine Thousand Four Hundred Forty Only

Receiver's Signature:
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B/17123,4:43 PM

s F"l vl -r tt,t

Shri Sode Vadiraja Mutt Education Trust Mail - Fwd: Regarding Energy audit

Satheesha Udupa <office@sode-edu.in>

Fwd: Regarding Energy audit

Prof. Dr. Thirumateshwara Bhat <principal@sode-edu.in>
To: Satheesha Udupa <office@sode-edu.in>

Thu,Aug 17,2023 at4:33 Pl\tl

Dear Office Supdt

Please do the needful to pay the advance amount.

Forwarded message
From: Benet George <benet@bigetaenergy.com>
Date: Wed, Aug 16, 2023 al5:10 PM
Subject: Re: Regarding Energy audit
To: Dr. Sudarshan Rao K <qa@sode-edu.in>
Cc: Smitha Benet <smitha(@bigetaenergy.com>, SIUVITM BANTAKAL UDUPI <principal@sode-edu.in>, Mr Vinayaka
<me@sode-edu.in>, Office of the Principal <op@sode-edu.in>

L Dear Sir,

Thankfully acknowledging the receipt of work order.
Attached the proforma invoice and bank details for advance payment.

Also details as per attached excel sheet is required for initial analysis before the start of the audit.
Request you to arrange the details at the earliest.
ln case of any query please feel free to contact me.

Thanks & Regards

Benet George V
BEE Accredited Energy Auditor

Bigeta Enorgy Soliltions - An ISO 9001:2015 Company

M: +91 9611800893

E: benet@bigetaenergy,com

A: Sarjapur, Bengaluru-562 125

W: w'rllrv. bigetae nergy. co,'n
*Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail

(-_
On Wed, Aug 16, 2023 al4:42PltA Dr. Sudarshan Rao K <qa@sode-edu.in> wrote

Dear Sir,
Please find the attached work order for green and energy audit.
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Dr. Sudarshan Rao K, 8.E., N/.Tech, Ph.D.

Dean (Quality Assurance)

Professor, Depaftrnent af lllechanical Engineering

Shri A[odhwo Vodirojo Institute of Technology & Monogement

Vishwothama Nagar/Eantakal/Udupi - 574 115, Karnatako, India

Phone : *97 - 9611615001 (O) / +91 - 9448252890 (lA)

URL : vvww.sode-edu.in

On Tue, Jul 25, 2023 at4:53 PM Benet George <benet@bigetaenergy.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,

t'

httnc'//mail nnnnla anm/mailtttlnttr'-^4 ^'co'^r^o''r- - -r'

Good Afternoon,
Please find the attached proposal for green and energy audit

Regards
Benet George V
3EE Accredited Energy Auditor

your kin
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